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Unique ID. Name of 
State/UT Name of District Disease/ Illness No. of 

Cases 
No. of 
Deaths 

Date of 
Start of 

Outbreak 

Date of 
Reporting 

Current 
Status Comments/ Action Taken 

AP/VKP/2018/17/538 Andhra 
Pradesh Visakhapatnam 

Suspected 
Cutaneous 
Anthrax 

19 00 23-04-18 24-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases reported from Village PHC R.V. Nagar, 
Chintapalli Mandal. Madem colony village, 
G.K. Veedhi PHC & Mandal Gengigedda.  
District RRT investigated the outbreak. House 
to house survey done. Direct smear and blood 
samples collected by Department of 
Microbiology, Andhra Medical College, 
Visakhapatnam; result awaited. Vaccination of 
animal population and collection of samples for 
testing was ensured. All cases treated 
symptomatically. Health education given on 
adverse effects of ingestion of dead animals 
and safe burial of dead animals. 

CT/BBR/2018/17/539 Chhatisgarh Balodabazar 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

81 00 23-04-18 25-04-18 Under 
Control 

Cases of loose stools with vomiting reported 
from Village Katgi mahamayapara, PHC Katgi, 
Block Kasdol. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done.  Health 
camp organized in the affected area and 
symptomatic treatment given. Water 
chlorination done in drinking water sources. 
Relevant health education given. 

GJ/DAH/2018/17/540 Gujarat Dahod 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

23 00 21-04-18 25-04-18 Under 
Control 

Cases reported from Village Akshardham 
Society, Sahkarnagar Area, Dahod Urban. 
District RRT investigated the outbreak. House 
to house survey done. Outbreak occurred 
probably due to consumption of contaminated 
water. 02 Water Samples sent to District 
Laboratory, Dahod; results awaited. ORS and 
chlorine tabs distributed in the community. 
Pipeline leakages were repaired and sewage 
cleared. Health Education given about 
sanitation practices and waste disposal. IEC 
activities for maintaining hygiene, hand 
washing, safe drinking water and food safety 
practices. All cases treated symptomatically. 
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GJ/KHD/2018/17/541 Gujarat Kheda Food 
Poisoning 37 00 24-04-18 25-04-18 Under 

Control 

Cases of vomiting with pain abdomen reported 
from Village/SC Sinjiwada, PHC Daloli, Block 
Matar. District RRT investigated the outbreak. 
House to house survey done. One stool sample 
sent to DPHL Nadiad; was negative for 
Cholera. Cases are due to food consumed 
during lunch in a marriage ceremony. Food, 
drugs department and local police station 
informed for necessary actions. Health camp 
organized in the school and all cases treated 
symptomatically. Relevant health education 
given. 

GJ/KHD/2018/17/542 Gujarat Kheda Food 
Poisoning 55 00 28-04-18 29-04-18 Under 

Surveillance 

Cases of vomiting with pain abdomen reported 
from Village/SC Bhumas, PHC Singhali, Block  
Mahudha. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done. Cases 
were probably due to food consumed during 
lunch in a marriage ceremony. Food sample 
(Mango Rus) collected by Food and Drugs 
Department; result awaited. Health camp 
organized in the school and all cases treated 
symptomatically. Health education given. 

GJ/NAV/2018/17/543 Gujarat Navsari 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

22 00 22-04-18 23-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases reported from Village Chikhli, Kangvai 
Bodvank. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done. 05 stool 
and 05 water samples sent to DPHL Navsar; 
report awaited. Stool samples were negative for 
cholera and all water samples were nonpotable. 
ORS distribution and chlorination done in the 
community. All cases treated symptomatically. 
Relevant health education given. 

HR/KMN/2018/17/544 Haryana Karnal Measles?? 12 00 29-04-18 02-05-18 Under 
Control 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village 
Narukheri PHC Barota, CHC Nissing. District 
RRT investigated the outbreak. House to house 
survey done. 07 blood samples sent to Lab, 
Panchkula were negative for Measles IgM 
ELISA. Vitamin A syrup administered to 
children in affected village. People advised to 
isolate cases and ensure immunization. All 
cases treated symptomatically. Health 
education given. 
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HP/MAN/2018/17/545 Himachal 
Pradesh Mandi 

Acute 
Diarrheal 
Disease 

27 0 27-04-18 28-04-18 Under 
Control 

Cases reported from Village Baha, CHC 
Nagwain, Block Kataula. District RRT 
investigated the outbreak. House to house 
survey done. 02 Water Samples sent to DPHL 
ZH. Mandi; result awaited. 01 Stool sample 
sent to DPHL. ZH. Mandi.  No Ova & Cyst 
seen in wet mount. No vibrio like motility seen 
in Hanging Drop. Result awaited for culture 
and sensitivity. All cases treated 
symptomatically. Relevant health education 
given. 

JH/KOE/2018/17/546 Jharkhand Koderma Food 
Poisoning 44 00 28-04-18 28-04-18 Under 

Surveillance 

Cases reported from Village Satgawan , 
Marchoi. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done. 
Outbreak was possibly due to food consumed 
during a marriage ceremony. Food samples 
(Sweets Kalakand, Rasgulla, Fruits, catlet, etc.) 
sent for testing to State food lab Directorate, 
Namkum, Ranchi; result awaited. Health camp 
organized in the school and all cases treated 
symptomatically. Health education given. 

KN/DVA/2018/17/547 Karnataka Davangere Food 
Poisoning 50 00 28-04-18 29-04-18 Under 

Control 

Cases reported from Village Thilineeckatte 
Jayanthinagar, PHC/CHC Nallur, Taluk 
Channagiri. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done. Food 
(Puri, Payasa, Ladu, Rice and vegetable curry) 
consumed at a marriage function was the likely 
cause of the outbreak. Water samples were 
portable and fit for drinking. Health camp 
organized in the school and all cases treated 
symptomatically. Relevant health education 
given. 

KN/GUL/2018/17/548 Karnataka Kalaburagi Chikungunya 22 00 28-04-18 29-04-18 Under 
Control 

Cases of fever reported from Village Ashraya 
colony area, PHC/CHC Shahbazar, Taluk 
Kalaburagi. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house fever survey done. 
Out of 12 serum samples, 5 samples were 
positive for IgM ELISA Chikungunya. All 
cases treated symptomatically. Larva survey 
and source reduction activities done. Relevant 
health education given. 
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KN/BIJ/2018/17/549 Karnataka Bijapur Chikungunya 49 00 25-04-18 25-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever reported from Village 
Adavisomanal, PHC/CHC Naltwad, Taluk 
Muddebihal. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done. Source 
Reduction and anti-larval activities conducted. 
04 Blood samples sent; 01 positive for 
Chikungunya IgM ELISA. All cases treated 
symptomatically. Health education given. 

KL/IDK/2018/17/550 Kerala Idukki 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

25 01 23-04-18 25-04-18 Under 
Control 

Cases reported from Village Kottakambbor, 
PHC PHC Vattavada, Block Chithirapuram. 
District RRT investigated the outbreak. House 
to house survey done.  01 water and 01 stool 
sample collected; result awaited. ORS 
Distribution and IEC on personal hygiene and 
sanitation done in the community. All cases 
treated symptomatically. Health education 
given. 

MP/GUN/2018/17/551 Madhya 
Pradesh Guna 

Acute 
Encephalitis 
Syndrome 

10 03 24-04-18 26-04-18 Under 
Control 

Cases of fever with headache and convulsions 
reported from Village Bhadora, Karnavata, 
Bharatpur. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done.  Blood 
and CSF samples sent to Medical College 
Gwalior and AIIMS Bhopal. No organism 
isolated from culture. All cases treated 
symptomatically. Health education given. 

MP/KHR/2018/17/552 Madhya 
Pradesh Khargon 

Acute 
Diarrheal 
Disease 

46 00 23-04-18 25-04-18 Under 
Control 

Cases reported from Village Londi, PHC 
Kanapur, CHC/Block Barwah. District RRT 
investigated the outbreak. House to house 
survey done. There were 27 males and 19 
females. 02 stool samples sent to MGM 
medical college Indore; result awaited. Water 
samples sent to PHE department Barwah and 
were potable.  Special medical camp organized 
and all cases treated symptomatically. Chlorine 
tablets and ORS packets distributed in the 
community.  Health education given. 
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MP/RJG/2018/17/553 Madhya 
Pradesh Rajgarh Dengue 24 00 19-04-18 24-04-18 Under 

Surveillance 

Cases reported from Village Bhura, SHC 
Dhakora , PHC Napanera, CHC Suthaliya 
Block-BIaora . District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house fever survey done. 
Blood samples sent to DMO lab, Bhopal. Two 
samples confirmed dengue and one sample 
confirmed Chikungunya by IgM ELISA. All 
cases treated symptomatically. Health 
education given. 

MN/CDL/2018/17/554 Manipur Chandel 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

07 00 27-04-18 2-05-18 Under 
Control 

Cases reported from Village Modi. District 
RRT investigated the outbreak. House to house 
survey done. 06 blood and 03 swab samples 
collected sent to at State Referral Lab IDSP, 
JNIMS, Manipur result awaited. All cases 
treated symptomatically. Health education 
given. 

NL/PER/2018/17/555 Nagaland Peren Food 
Poisoning 38 00 27-04-18 27-04-18 Under 

Surveillance 

Cases of vomiting with loose stools reported 
from Village New Chalkot CHC Jalukie. 
District RRT investigated the outbreak. House 
to house survey done. Outbreak was probably 
due to consuming pork in a common 
community festival. Health camp organized in 
the school and all cases treated 
symptomatically. Relevant health education 
given. 

PB/MNS/2018/17/556 Punjab Mansa 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

460 00 24-04-18 25-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of vomiting with loose stools reported 
from Village/SC/PHC Ubha, Block- Khiala 
kalan. District RRT investigated the outbreak. 
House to house survey done. Contamination of 
drinking water supply with sewage due to 
corrosion in supply pipe was the likely cause of 
outbreak. Water, stool and blood sample sent to 
DPHL Mansa. Water samples found 
nonpotable. Stool sample found E Coli in 
culture and no organism was isolated from 
blood samples. ORS distributed in the 
community. All cases treated symptomatically. 
Relevant health education given. 
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PB/SAS/2018/17/557 Punjab Sasnagar Chickenpox 27 00 26-04-18 27-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Govt. 
Primary School, Village Sohana, Block 
Ghruan. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done. Cases 
advised isolation and infection control 
measures. All cases treated symptomatically. 
Health education given. 

RJ/ALW/2018/17/558 Rajasthan Alwar Acute Gastro 
Enteritis 251 00 24-04-18 27-04-18 Under 

Surveillance 

Cases of vomiting with loose stools reported 
from Village Silawat, CHC Tehla, Block 
Rajgarh. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done. Food 
consumption at marriage ceremony was the 
possible cause of outbreak. 04 stool samples 
sent to SMS Medical College, Jaipur; result 
awaited. Community was made aware of food 
and general hygiene. Health camp organized in 
the school and all cases treated 
symptomatically. 

RJ/BWR/2018/17/559 Rajasthan Banswara 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

52 00 20-04-18 24-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of loose stools with vomiting reported 
from Village/PHC/Block Bagidora. District 
RRT investigated the outbreak. House to house 
survey done. 05 Food and 01 vomit sample 
sent to Food safety and Standard Lab RNT 
Medical College Udaipur; Results awaited. All 
cases treated symptomatically. Health 
Education given and community educated to 
discard old cooked food. 

TN/DDG/2018/17/560 Tamil Nadu Dindigul Chikungunya 22 00 19-04-18 23-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever reported from Village Athoor, 
Ayyampalayam, Ayyampalayam, A.Pudur. 
District RRT investigated the outbreak. House 
to house survey done. 06 Serum, 13 Smear 
samples sent to DPHL, Dindigul. 06 Samples 
also sent to IVC&Z, Hosur and GPHC 
Ayyampalayam; 02 samples were positive for 
Chikungunya, 01 sample was positive for 
Dengue and 01 was positive for Typhoid. Anti 
larval work, fogging and source reduction 
done. All cases treated symptomatically. 
Relevant health education given in the 
community. 
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TN/DDG/2018/17/561 Tamil Nadu Dindigul Chickenpox 09 00 21-04-18 23-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases reported from Village Reddiarchatram, 
H.R.Kottai, H.R.Kottai, Alavachipatti. District 
RRT investigated the outbreak. House to house 
survey done. All cases treated symptomatically. 
Health education given on isolation and 
disinfection of cases. 

TN/RMN/2018/17/562 Tamil Nadu Ramanathapura
m 

Chikungunya?
? 23 00 23-04-18 24-04-18 Under 

Surveillance 

Cases of fever reported from Village 
Parayankulam, SC Kathanendal, PHC 
Kovilangulam, Block Kamudhi. District RRT 
investigated the outbreak. House to house fever 
survey done. All cases treated symptomatically. 
Health Education given to cover all water 
storage containers and keep environment clean. 
Adequate hydration with ORS ensured for 
cases. Indoor and outdoor fogging done in the 
community. 

TN/AIR/2018/17/563 Tamil Nadu Ariyallur 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

06 00 26-04-18 28-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases reported from Village 'Pirancheri, 
SC/PHC 'Vizhapallam, Block 'Jayankondan. 
District RRT investigated the outbreak. House 
to house survey done. 03 water samples sent to 
Ariyallur GH were potable. Chlorination of 
overhead tank and drinking water sources done. 
Health Education given on hand washing and 
personal hygiene. All cases treated 
symptomatically. 

UP/BAH/2018/17/564 Uttar Pradesh Baharaich Measles?? 31 03 21-04-18 24-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases reported from Village Kataha, Rahman 
Nagar. PHC/ Block PHC- Tejwapur. District 
RRT investigated the outbreak. House to house 
survey done. All cases were between 7 months- 
13 years of age. 02 cases were more than 10 yrs 
of age. Only 02 cases were completely 
vaccinated. 03 deaths reported. 1) 
Monisha,5y,F, 2)Gulafsa,4y,F 
3)Chandani,7y,F. 06 blood samples sent to 
SGPGI, Lucknow; results awaited. All cases 
treated symptomatically. Vitamin A 
supplementation given to eligible children in 
the community. Sensitization about timely 
vaccination, cleanliness and hygiene given in 
the community. 
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UP/BBN/2018/17/565 Uttar Pradesh Bara- Banki Chickenpox 08 00 24-04-18 27-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village 
Baal Sanrachan Grah Dewa Road, PHC Urban, 
CHC Jata Barauli, Block Banki. District RRT 
investigated the outbreak. House to house 
survey done. Most of the cases (06) were above 
10years of age. Symptomatic treatment given 
to cases. Health education given regarding 
isolation of cases in the community. 

UP/RBL/2018/17/566 Uttar Pradesh Rai-Bareilly Food 
Poisoning 52 00 25-04-18 25-04-18 Under 

Control 

Cases of vomiting with loose stools reported 
from Village Pure Shuklan Dera, CHC 
Maharajganj, Block Maharajganj, Raebareli. 
District RRT investigated the outbreak. House 
to house survey done. Out of the total cases, 31 
are female and 21 are male. Outbreak was 
possibly due to consumption of contaminated 
and stale pig meat in a local feast. Health camp 
organized in the school and all cases treated 
symptomatically. Health education given. 

UA/RDP/2018/17/567 Uttarakhand Rudraprayag 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

09 00 26-04-18 28-04-18 Under 
Control 

Cases reported from Village Syanshu, Sub 
Centre Kalimath, Block Ukhimath. District 
RRT investigated the outbreak. House to house 
survey done. 02 blood samples sent to IDSP 
Referral Lab Govt. Medical College Srinagar 
and 01 water sample sent to Jal Sansthan, 
Rudraprayag for evaluation. Both blood 
samples tested negative for Hepatitis- A and – 
E by IgM ELISA. Water samples were non-
potable. All cases treated symptomatically. 
Health education given. 

WB/PRL/2018/17/568 West Bengal Purulia 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

42 00 22-04-18 23-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases reported from Village Agarbaid, 
Ketonkeyari, Block Kashipur. District RRT 
investigated the outbreak. House to house 
survey done. Clustering of cases at Agarbaid 
village under ketankeyari sub-center. Tubewell 
is the source of drinking water. People use a 
common pond which is the probable source of 
contamination. Rectal swabs found growth of 
normal commensal and water samples were 
nonpotable. (From Tubewell and pond). All 
cases treated symptomatically. Health 
education given. 
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WB/MLD/2018/17/569 West Bengal Malda 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

61 00 26-04-18 27-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases reported from Village Bhathuri, GP 
Bathuri-II, Block:-Egra-II. District RRT 
investigated the outbreak. House to house 
survey done. Contamination of drinking water 
supplied from Panchayat was likely the cause 
of outbreak. 07 stool samples collected and 
sent to STM lab, Kolkata; result pending. All 
cases treated symptomatically. Distribution of 
Chlorine Tablets, ORS and Bleaching Powder 
done. Health education on hand washing and 
disinfection of drinking water supply was done. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

DISEASE OUTBREAKS OF PREVIOUS WEEKS REPORTED LATE 

Unique ID. Name of 
State/UT Name of District Disease/ Illness No. of 

Cases 
No. of 
Deaths 

Date of 
Start 

Outbreak 

Current 
Status Comments/ Action Taken 

AS/GLP/2018/17/570 Assam Goalpara Measles?? 07 00 14-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village Simlabari, SC 
Nil, PHC Ambari, Block Rangjul. District RRT investigated 
the outbreak. House to house survey done. Cases were from 
0-10 yrs of age. Only 3 cases had received measles 
vaccination. 01 Blood and 1 Throat Swab samples were sent 
to RMRC, Dibrugarh; result awaited. Symptomatic treatment 
given to cases. 02 consecutive doses of vitamin A 
administered to all cases. Health education given for 
personal hygiene, cleanliness etc. 
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AS/LKM/2018/17/571 Assam Lakhimpur 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

28 00 15-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of vomiting with loose stools reported from Village 
Ananda TE, MPHC Chauldhuwa, BPHC Boginodi. Increase 
in number of acute diarrheal disease cases at weekly 
syndromic (S form) as well as provisional diagnostic format 
(P form) submitted from Ananda TE in week no-16. District 
RRT investigated the outbreak. House to house survey done. 
Poor sanitary conditions observed in all lines of tea garden. 
04 rectal swabs were collected and sent to DPHL, IDSP, 
Lakhimpur for culture. All cases treated symptomatically. 
Health education given for safe drinking water, personal 
hygiene and cleanliness etc. Halogen tablets and ORS 
distributed in the community. 

BH/NAW/2018/17/572 Bihar Nawada Measles?? 14 00 18-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village Bhandajaur 
musahri, PHC/Block Roah. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done. Cases belong to age 
group of 0-12 yrs. Most affected age group was 0-6yrs. 04 
Blood samples sent to PMCH Patna; result awaited. Vitamin 
A supplementation given to children of 0-15yrs. Entire 
community was sensitized to complete routine 
immunization. All cases treated symptomatically. Relevant 
health education given. 

BH/NLD/2018/17/573 Bihar Nalanda Chickenpox 11 00 02-04-18 Under 
Control 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village Gwalbigha, 
HSC Binsa Salempur, PHC karaiparsurai, Block Karaipars. 
District RRT investigated the outbreak. House to house 
active case search done. 5 male and 6 female children were 
affected. All cases treated symptomatically. Health education 
given to the community for isolation of cases. 

BH/SMP/2018/17/574 Bihar Samastipur Measles?? 23 00 01-03-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village Mughlani 
Chak Ward No.-10, SC Lakhanpatti, PHC/Block 
Warisnagar. District RRT investigated the outbreak. House 
to house survey done. All the cases were between 1- 53 years 
of age. 05 Blood samples sent to PMCH Patna; result 
awaited. All cases treated symptomatically. Health 
Education given for isolation of cases. 

DL/STE/2018/17/575 Delhi South East Measles?? 11 00 05-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village Main Market 
Badarpur, MCW Center Badarpur. District RRT investigated 
the outbreak. House to house survey done. Age group of 
affected cases was from 7 months - 30 Years.  05 serum 
samples sent to NCDC, Delhi for testing IgM Measles; result 
awaited. All cases were given symptomatic treatment and 
Vit -A.  Health education given. 
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DL/DLN/2018/17/576 Delhi North District Cholera 05 00 17-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of diarrhea reported from Village Dharola , Delhi, 
under MCW Indra Nagar, Sub Division Model Town. 
District RRT investigated the outbreak. House to house 
active case search done. Drinking water supply sent for 
testing; result awaited. Survey in area to identify hidden 
cases in community. All cases treated symptomatically. 
Health education given. 

GJ/JNR/2018/17/577 Gujarat Jamnagar Measles?? 25 00 16-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village Mota Vas, SC 
Jodiya-3, PHC Hadiyana, Block Jodiya. District RRT 
investigated the outbreak. House to house survey done. 05 
blood, 02 throat and urine samples sent to BJMC 
Ahmedabad; result awaited. Vitamin A therapeutic doses 
given to the affected cases.  All cases treated 
symptomatically. Relevant health education given. 

KL/ERN/2018/17/578 Kerala Ernakulam Dengue 37 00 10-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever with myalgia reported from Village 
Rayonpuram, PHC THQH Perumbavoor, Block 
Malayidamthuruth. District RRT investigated the outbreak. 
House to house survey done. All suspected cases reported 
from ward 27&24. 05 serum samples were confirmed 
positive for Dengue. (IgM ELISA) Multiple breeding sites 
identified from house premises and scrap centers. All cases 
treated symptomatically. Health education given. 

KKL/TRC/2018/17/579 Kerala Thrissur Hepatitis A 18 00 29-03-18 Under 
Control 

Cases reported from Village Elavally, SC Elavally, 
Kakkaserry, PHC Elavally, Block Mullassery. District RRT 
investigated the outbreak. House to house survey done. Food 
shared in kalam paattu festival was likely the cause of 
outbreak. 02 serum sample sent to DMO(H) lab and 1 water 
sample sent to water authority lab Kizhakumpattukara 
Thrissur; results awaited. All cases treated symptomatically. 
Chlorination done. Health education given. 

MH/AKL/2018/17/580 Maharashtra Akola Measles?? 18 00 04-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village Akola 
Corporation Area Naigaon, Khadan, Dabki Roada, Ashok 
Nager. District RRT investigated the outbreak. House to 
house survey done. Serum sample sent to NIV Pune for 
Measles; report awaited. Vit-A Prophylaxis given to eligible 
cases in the community. Immunization and symptomatic 
treatment given to cases. Health education given. 
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MH/AKL/2018/17/581 Maharashtra Akola Cholera 13 00 17-04-18 Under 
Control 

Cases of loose stools with vomiting reported from 
Village/SC Rahit, Pinjar Tq. Barshitakli. District RRT 
investigated the outbreak. House to house survey done.  06 
water samples tested for Orthotoluidine and 04 water 
samples were non potable. 01 stool sample sent to GMC 
Akola, confirmed Cholera in culture. All cases treated 
symptomatically. Health education given. 

MH/JLN/2018/17/582 Maharashtra Jalna Dengue 18 01 02-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever with joint pains reported from Village/SC 
Ramasgaon, PHC Tirthapuri, Block Ghansawa. District RRT 
investigated the outbreak. House to house survey done. 13 
serum samples sent to sentinel center, Aurangabad. 03 
samples are positive for Dengue IgG Elisa. Larval survey 
and source reduction done in the community. All cases 
treated symptomatically. Health education given. 

MH/SGL/2018/17/583 Maharashtra Sangli 
Acute 

Diarrheal 
Disease 

47 00 13-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases reported from Village Bhatwadi, SC Kalamwadi, PHC 
Nerle, Block Walwa . District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done. Water Supplied 
without purification was the likely cause of outbreak. 23 
Water samples taken and among them 2 were contaminated. 
All cases treated symptomatically. Cases advised 
purification of water supply, use of boiled drinking water 
and to clean drainage gatars. 

UP/PRT/2018/17/584 Uttar Pradesh Pratapgarh Measles 19 00 20-03-18 Under 
Control 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village Pure jeet 
Katra, SC Hathigawa, CHC/Block Kunda. District RRT 
investigated the outbreak. House to house survey done. Most 
of the cases belong to 0-5 year- 4 (M-1, F-3) and 5-10 year 
15(M-9, F-6). All cases treated symptomatically. Health 
education given regarding personal hygiene and isolation. 

UP/RBL/2018/17/585 Uttar Pradesh Rai-Bareilly Chickenpox 09 00 10-04-18 Under 
Control 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village Pahrawan, 
CHC /Block Amawan,. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done. All cases are in 2 – 
18yrs age group. One serum and one throat sample sent to 
Department of Microbiology, KGMC for testing. Anti V2V 
IgM antibody ELISA (Serum) negative. Symptomatic 
treatment given to cases. Health education given regarding 
isolation of cases. 
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UP/RBL/2018/17/586 Uttar Pradesh Rai-Bareilly Measles 08 01 15-04-18 Under 
Control 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village Pahrawan, 
CHC/ Block Amawan. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done. The cases are in the 6 
to 11yrs age group. Out of total affected persons 3 are female 
and 5 are male. One serum and one throat sample sent to 
Department of Microbiology KGMC Lab. Measles detected 
from Real Time PCR. All cases treated symptomatically. 06 
children immunized and 18 children given vitamin A 
supplementation in the community. Health education given. 

UP/SHV/2018/17/587 Uttar Pradesh Shravasti Measles?? 13 00 17-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases reported from Village Ikauna,Ikauna Dehat,Pandit 
Purwa. District RRT investigated the outbreak. House to 
house survey done. 05 Blood samples sent to SGPGI, 
Lucknow; result awaited. All cases treated symptomatically. 
Health education given. 

UP/SID/2018/17/588 Uttar Pradesh Siddharth Nagar Measles?? 07 00 16-04-18 Under 
Surveillance 

Cases of fever with rash reported from Village Kakodi, SC 
Mahadewa Bazzar. PHC/ Block Naugarh. District RRT 
investigated the outbreak. House to house survey done. 

Age group Cases 
01- 05 years 02 
06-10 years 04 
>10 years 01 

06 serum samples sent to SGPGI, Lucknow; Result awaited. 
All cases treated symptomatically. IEC activities undertaken 
regarding isolation and early treatment of cases. Vitamin A 
solution given to effected cases. 

WB/DKJ/2018/17/589 West Bengal Uttar Dinajpur 
District Fever 40 00 16-04-18 Under 

Control 

Cases reported from Village Tangra, GP: Sitgram, SC 
Chopra, Block: Raiganj. District RRT investigated the 
outbreak. House to house survey done. 05 blood samples 
collected; result awaited. All cases treated symptomatically. 
Isolation of affected cases advised and Vit. A prophylaxis 
given. 

 
 
 
 
 


